Statutory Instrument No. 52 of 2006

BOTSWANA DEFENCE FORCE ACT
(Cap. 21:05)

DEFENCE FORCE (REGULAR FORCE) (OFFICERS) (AMENDMENT)

REGULATIONS, 2006
(Published on 18th August, 2006)

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS

REGULATIONS

1. Citation

2. Amendment of regulation 4 of Cap. 21:05 (Sub. Leg.)
3. Amendment of regulation S of the Regulations

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred on the President by section 178 of the Botswana
Defence Force Act, the following Regulations are hereby made —

Citation

Amendment
of regulation
4 of Cap.
21:05

(Sub. Leg.)
Amendment
of regulation
S of the
regulasons

L2/7/242 VIII

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Defence Force (Regular Force)
(Officers) (Amendment) Regulations, 2006.

2. Regulation 4 of the Defence Force (Regular Force) (Officers)
Regulations (hereinafter referred to as “the Regulations”) is hereby amended in
subregulation (6) by substituting, for the words “six months’ notice”, the words
“three months’ notice”.

3. Regulation 5 of the Regulations is amended in subregulation 1 (a) by
substituting, for the words “six months’ notice”, the words “three months’
notice.”

MADE this 19th day of July, 2006.

F.G. MOGAE,
President.



